
10f1999

Citationand
commencement

Amendmentof
reg. 2 of the
Company
Management
(Fees)
Regulations

Amendmentof
reg. 3 of the
principal
Regulations

COMPANY MANAGEMENT (LICENSING) (FEES)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009

(Legal Notice 15 of2009)

MADE by the Governor under sections 7 and 25 of the Company
Management (Licensing) Ordinance

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Company
Management (Licensing) (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2009.

2. The Company Management (Licensing) (Fees) Regulations
(hereinafter referred to as the "principal Regulations") are
amended, in regulation 2, by deleting the words "$500" and
"$200" and substituting therefor the words "$750" and "$350"
respectively.

3. Regulation 3 of the principal Regulations is amended -

(a) in paragraph (a), by deleting the word "$2,000" and
substituting therefor the word "$3,000"; and

(b) in paragraph (b), by deleting the word "$2,000" and
substituting therefor the word "$2,500".

MADE this ~ day of September 2009

GORDON WETHERELL
GOVERNOR



j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j

j


